
Bid Tabulation:  RFB 36-05DEC23
Ballistic/Stab Combo Resistant Body 
Armor - Term & Supply

Bid Tabulation Princip Defense Galls LLC Southern Uniform & Tactical

4.10.1 Ballistic/Stab Combo Resistant 
Body Armor Level NIJ IIIA – Ballistic & 
Spike 3 with an extra carrier for a 
total of two (2) carriers.

375.00$                                                         831.35$                                                         1,230.00$                                                      

4.10.2 Add-on fee for any 
alteration/adjustment done to the 
vest after the allowed 30-day period 
– see paragraph 2.5.1 herein.

No response -$                                                                $70/$35
See bid 

4.10.3 Guardian Zip-Front Exterior 
Carrier, Silver, Tan

 $195/$175
See bid 

194.15$                                                         290.00$                                                         

4.10.4 Molle Double Cuff Holder for 
Guardian Carrier, Silver, Tan

20.00$                                                           No Bid 19.25$                                                           

4.10.5 Molle Radio Carrier for 
Guardian Carrier, Silver, Tan

20.00$                                                           No Bid 29.99$                                                           

 4.10.6 Molle Double MagHolder for 
Guardian Carrier, Silver, Tan 

20.00$                                                           No Bid 29.99$                                                           

4.10.7 Molle Open Top Flashlight 
Holder for Guardian Carrier, Silver, 
Tan

20.00$                                                           No Bid 22.99$                                                           

First Renewal Option Adjustment 0% 5% 5%

Second Renewal Option Adjustment 0% 5% 7.5%

Third Renewal Option Adjustment 0% 5% 9%

Co-Op Yes No response Yes
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